

Specify Brand	Specify	Ounces			Pounds					Pints		Quarts		Gallons					Comments	2021 Primary		
		1	16	20	1	1.25	3	5	20	1	2	1	2	1	2.5	5	30	250			265	
F	GLYPHOSATE																					
	GreenPoint Ag	Cornerstone Plus													11.00							P
	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC.	Credit Extra													11.55		11.10		11.00			
	Krenek Seed	Ag Saver 41%															10.25					P
	Red River Specialties, LLC.	Compare & Save													11.94		11.22			275 gal tote 10.88		
G	2-4 D																					
	GreenPoint Ag	24D Amine													10.20		9.90		9.60			P
	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC.	24d Amine													10.95		10.55		10.35			
	Krenek Seed	24D Amine													11.00		10.50		9.95			
	Red River Specialties, LLC.	Weedar 64													11.49		10.98		10.78			
H	SURMONT																					
	GreenPoint Ag														53.64		52.53					
	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC.														58.50		57.50					
	Krenek Seed	Triumph XTR													48.50							P
	Red River Specialties, LLC.																52.52					P
I	90% NON-IONIC SURFACTANT																					
	GreenPoint Ag	Preference													13.00	13.00				12.00		
	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC.	Ad Spray 90													15.90							
	Krenek Seed	Alligare 90													12.00							
	Red River Specialties, LLC.	RRSI NIS													9.48		9.28					P
J	DRIFT CONTROL																					
	GreenPoint Ag	Interlock													50.00				49.00			
	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC.	Justified													44.25							P
	Krenek Seed	Alligare Drift											10.50									
	Red River Specialties, LLC.	Elite Secure Ultra										9.15		26.15								P
K	Habitat																					
	GreenPoint Ag	no bid																				
	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC.	Polaris													54.55							
	Krenek Seed	same as A																				
	Red River Specialties, LLC.	Arsenal Herbicide													51.89	49.95	49.50					P

Specify Brand	Specify	Ounces			Pounds					Pints		Quarts		Gallons					Comments	2021 Primary			
		1	16	20	1	1.25	3	5	20	1	2	1	2	1	2.5	5	30	250			265		
W	PLATEAU																						
	GreenPoint Ag	no bid																					
	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC.	no bid																					
	Krenek Seed	Panoramic													109.00								P
	Red River Specialties, LLC.													109.95									P
X	OUTRIDER																						
	GreenPoint Ag	no bid																					
	Helena Agri-Enterprises, LLC.			14.80																		P	
	Krenek Seed	no bid																					
	Red River Specialties, LLC.			16.09																			
Y	PERSPECTIVE																						
		no bid																					
Z	METHOD																						
		no bid																					

Additional Information
