

**WHARTON COUNTY, TEXAS  
2021 OIL BASED ROAD MATERIAL  
JANUARY 1 - DECEMBER 31, 2021**

**P - Awarded Bidder**

Bids as presented to Commissioners' Court on November 23, 2020 **awarded on 11/23/20.**

**2021 Primary**

	PRODUCT/BIDDER	PIT LOCATION	MATERIAL ONLY PER TON	DELIVERED PER TON	DELIVERY MIN. TONS	MATERIAL ONLY PER GALLON	DELIVERED PER GAL.	DELIVERY MIN. GAL.	1	2	3	4
<b>A. MC-30 PRIME OIL</b>												
	Cleveland Asphalt		897.00	935.00	21	3.45	3.61	5,000				
	Martin Asphalt	300 Christi Place South Houston, TX 77587				2.65	2.77	5,000				
	Valero Marketing	See Attached - this is current daily rack and these prices are subject to change	675.00						P	P	P	P
<b>B. AC-5</b>												
	Cleveland Asphalt		563.50	601.50	21	2.45	2.61	5,000				
	Martin Asphalt	300 Christi Place South Houston, TX 77587				1.98	2.10	5,000				
	Valero Marketing	See Attached - this is current daily rack and these prices are subject to change	405.00						P	P	P	P
<b>C. AE-P</b>												
	Cleveland Asphalt		504.00	542.00	21	2.00	2.16	5,000	P	P	P	P
	Martin Asphalt	300 Christi Place South Houston, TX 77587				2.25	2.37	5,000				
	Valero Marketing	no bid										
	P2 Emulsion Prime Concentrate	Elm Mott, TX	436.58	497.57	21	1.79	2.04	5000				
<b>D. CRS-2 (1 Ton/2,000 Gallon Max.Delivery)</b>												
	Cleveland Asphalt		416.50	516.25	8	1.75	2.15	2,000	P	P	P	P
	Martin Asphalt	300 Christi Place South Houston, TX 77587				1.85	1.97	5,000				
	Valero Marketing	no bid										
	P2 Emulsion CWE-2	Elm Mott, TX	668.29	729.26	21	2.74	2.99	5000				

	PRODUCT/BIDDER	PIT LOCATION	MATERIAL ONLY PER TON	DELIVERED PER TON	DELIVERY MIN. TONS	MATERIAL ONLY PER GALLON	DELIVERED PER GAL.	DELIVERY MIN. GAL.	1	2	3	4
<b>E.</b>	<b>EC-30 Prime Oil</b>											
	Cleveland Asphalt	no bid										
	Martin Asphalt	no bid										
	Valero Marketing	no bid										
	P2 Emulsion RTU	Elm Mott, TX	426.83	487.80	21	1.75	2.00	5000	P	P	P	P
<b>F.</b>	<b>RC-250</b>											
	Cleveland Asphalt		673.75	711.75	21	2.75	2.91	5,000				
	Martin Asphalt	300 Christi Place South Houston, TX 77587				2.55	2.67	5,000				
	Valero Marketing	See Attached - this is current daily rack and these prices are subject to change	615.00						P	P	P	P

**Comments:**

**Cleveland Asphalt:** All prices except CRS-2 are based on minimum 21 ton or 5000 gallon load, for smaller quantities please call 800-334-0177

CRS-2 is quote based on minimum order of 2000 gallons or its equivalent of 8 tons

Diluted material can not be returned for credit

**Martin Asphalt:** demurrage charge \$70/hour after 2 free hours.

**Valero:** see attached

**P2 Emulsion:** please see attached equivalent or superior information and Sole Source letter.

**P2 Emulsion:** is proudly recognized and accepted by Tarrant County Co-Op.